
*Child Care Subsidies may apply. $5 Admin Fee per family. $5 Late Fees apply within 7 days per child. Payment plans available.

**Experience/Activity Fee. Programs may be subject to change. Third Party Payment Fees apply. See Terms and Conditions for cancellation policy

Benton Junior College
7:00 AM START
6:30 PM END

PLEASE

ARRIVE BY 9AM

ON EXCURSION
DAYS

IN-HOUSE INCURSION EXCURSION

MON · 1st JUL

Storyland
Adventure

Embark on a whimsical journey
with Storyland Adventure! Dress

up as your favourite book
character and dive into your

own fairytale. Today we'll write
our own unique stories, do some
arts and crafts, and take home a
magical mixed fairy tale book.

Daily Fee $87

After Max CCS* $8.74

TUE · 2nd JUL

Inside Out 2

Are you ready for an emotional
rollercoaster?! TeamKids is off
to see 'Inside Out 2'. Join Joy,

Sadness, and the whole gang for
a heartwarming sequel full of

new adventures and feelings. It's
a journey you won't want to

miss! *PG Film.

Daily Fee $117

After Max CCS* $11.74

WED · 3rd JUL

Winter Olympics

Get ready to embark on a Winter
Olympics adventure! Join us for
an action-packed session of fun
activities including sport, games,
relay, and arts and crafts! We’ll

be feeling all the Olympic
excitement today.

Daily Fee $110

After Max CCS* $11.04

THU · 4th JUL

World of Bees

We're making a beeline for
TeamKids as Beekeeper Tom
introduces us to the buzzing

world of bees! We'll discover the
fascinating way bees make their

delicious honey & more. *No
bees present onsite.

Daily Fee $99

After Max CCS* $9.94

FRI · 5th JUL

Greatest Showman

Calling all little performers, we
have the ultimate experience
planned for you! Join us for a

day of theatrical music,
costumes, circus tricks, and
more. Let the magical show

begin!

Daily Fee $97

After Max CCS* $9.74

MON · 8th JUL

Tidepool Treasures

Dive into the fascinating world
of tidepools with TeamKids!

Meet the incredible creatures
that call our beaches and oceans
home. With hands-on activities
and up-close encounters, get

ready for a splash-tastic
adventure!

Daily Fee $106

After Max CCS* $10.64

TUE · 9th JUL

Rock Climbing

Today, we're making our way to
the top of the world as we go
Rock Climbing! We'll learn the

ropes & then there'll be
countless climbing challenges

for us to complete. How high will
you go? *Closed shoes are

required.

Daily Fee $119

After Max CCS* $11.94

WED · 10th JUL

Despicable Me 4

Get ready for mischief and
mayhem as TeamKids joins Gru
& the Minions in ‘Despicable Me

4'. We’re in for a wild ride,
facing off against a

mischievous new rival. Don't
miss out on this exciting

adventure! *PG Film.

Daily Fee $117

After Max CCS* $11.74

THU · 11th JUL

Wanyara: Play

Today we will be playing a
mixture of Indigenous games

including Buroinjin, Jumpinpin,
Wulijini and many more. Come
along to see what these are!

Daily Fee $98

After Max CCS* $9.84

FRI · 12th JUL

Take the Stage

Embrace your inner drama king
or queen! Students will kick off
with entertaining acting games,

igniting their creativity and
fostering teamwork. Then they'll
showcase their unique take on a
script – every performance is

different!

Daily Fee $98

After Max CCS* $9.84

FIND A VENUE
TEAMKIDS.COM.AU/VENUES

CHOOSE YOUR ADVENTURE
BOOK TODAY!

TEAMKIDS.COM.AU VERSION
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