
*Child Care Subsidies may apply. $5 Admin Fee per family. $5 Late Fees apply within 7 days per child. Payment plans available.

**Experience/Activity Fee. Programs may be subject to change. Third Party Payment Fees apply. See Terms and Conditions for cancellation policy

Garrang Wilam Primary - Truganina
6:45 AM START
18:15 END

PLEASE

ARRIVE BY 9AM

ON EXCURSION
DAYS

IN-HOUSE INCURSION EXCURSION

MON · 1st JUL

Storyland
Adventure

Embark on a whimsical journey
with Storyland Adventure! Dress

up as your favourite book
character and dive into your

own fairytale. Today we'll write
our own unique stories, do some
arts and crafts, and take home a
magical mixed fairy tale book.

Daily Fee $76

After Max CCS* $7.63

TUE · 2nd JUL

Virtual Reality

Get ready to ignite your
imagination and step into a

world of endless possibilities
when Dream City visits
TeamKids! Experience

interactive 3D adventures and
discover new cultures as you
travel the globe with virtual

reality.

Daily Fee $95

After Max CCS* $9.53

WED · 3rd JUL

Inside Out 2

Are you ready for an emotional
rollercoaster?! TeamKids is off
to see 'Inside Out 2'. Join Joy,

Sadness, and the whole gang for
a heartwarming sequel full of

new adventures and feelings. It's
a journey you won't want to

miss! *PG Film.

Daily Fee $106

After Max CCS* $10.63

THU · 4th JUL

Team Adrenaline!

TeamKids is ready to prove our
moves at Team Adrenaline! We’ll
use traditional gym equipment,

with a mix of martial arts,
parkour, tricking, and break

dancing! Get ready to roll, jump,
and dive into an awesome day!

Daily Fee $116

After Max CCS* $11.63

FRI · 5th JUL

Colour Run Games

Join us to paint the town
rainbow as we compete in a
colour run! Get drenched in

vibrant rainbow powder as we
race our friends! Wear white,
bring a towel and a change of

clothes! Have some active
colour-filled fun!

Daily Fee $95

After Max CCS* $9.53

MON · 8th JUL

Battle of the Bands

And a one, and a two and a… Get
ready to get groovin’ as we
experiment with different

instruments, songs and sounds
before battling it out in teams to

see who will be crowned the
ULTIMATE little rockers!

Daily Fee $87

After Max CCS* $8.73

TUE · 9th JUL

Despicable Me 4

Get ready for mischief and
mayhem as TeamKids joins Gru
& the Minions in ‘Despicable Me

4'. We’re in for a wild ride,
facing off against a

mischievous new rival. Don't
miss out on this exciting

adventure! *PG Film.

Daily Fee $106

After Max CCS* $10.63

WED · 10th JUL

The Trivia
Champions

Attention trivia enthusiasts!
TeamKids presents the ultimate

trivia challenge for you! Gather a
friend and test your skills with a

series of exciting trivia
challenges and games, all

centred around themes from
movies, TV shows, and sports.

Daily Fee $89

After Max CCS* $8.93

THU · 11th JUL

3street Hoop Time

Get ready for a slam-dunkin’
time! Join us for an action-

packed day, filled with thrilling
basketball games, drills, and epic

tournaments.

Daily Fee $107

After Max CCS* $10.73

FRI · 12th JUL

Indigenous Infusion

Get immersed in Indigenous
cultures with Indigenous

Infusion this NAIDOC Week. Join
us for a highly interactive

program exploring different
cultural aspects such as Dance

and Didgeridoo, Indigenous
Artefacts & Storytelling.

Daily Fee $93

After Max CCS* $9.33

FIND A VENUE
TEAMKIDS.COM.AU/VENUES

CHOOSE YOUR ADVENTURE
BOOK TODAY!

TEAMKIDS.COM.AU VERSION
v20240701.2 1300 035 000


