
*Child Care Subsidies may apply. $5 Admin Fee per family. $5 Late Fees apply within 7 days per child. Payment plans available.

**Experience/Activity Fee. Programs may be subject to change. Third Party Payment Fees apply. See Terms and Conditions for cancellation policy

Minden State School
6:15 AM START
6:00 PM END

PLEASE

ARRIVE BY 9AM

ON EXCURSION
DAYS

IN-HOUSE INCURSION EXCURSION

MON · 24th JUN

HushHop Fusion

Get ready to groove with
HushHop Fusion! In this Silent
Hip Hop Disco we’ll learn epic
dance moves and party with

games. It's a silent dance
adventure — shake it off and
dance like nobody's listening!

Daily Fee $105

After Max CCS* $10.51

TUE · 25th JUN

Bowling

There's no time to spare!
TeamKids is hosting our very
own bowling tournament & we

need your help to knock down as
many pins as possible! Are you

& your friends up for the
challenge? *Socks required.

Daily Fee $122

After Max CCS* $12.21

WED · 26th JUN

Learn to Beatbox!

Today, TeamKids is making
music, but we won't need any

instruments! We'll learn to
beatbox with Jobe, a

professional beatboxer. Get
ready to rap, rhyme & vocal loop.

Daily Fee $107

After Max CCS* $10.71

THU · 27th JUN

Inside Out 2

Are you ready for an emotional
rollercoaster?! TeamKids is off
to see 'Inside Out 2'. Join Joy,

Sadness, and the whole gang for
a heartwarming sequel full of

new adventures and feelings. It's
a journey you won't want to

miss! *PG Film.

Daily Fee $124

After Max CCS* $12.41

FRI · 28th JUN

Rockets, Rockets
and More Rockets!

Blast off on an out-of-this-world
adventure as kids design and
construct their own rockets.

With the power of air and water,
watch these rockets skyrocket
into space - get ready for some

stellar stories!

Daily Fee $106

After Max CCS* $10.61

MON · 1st JUL

Storyland
Adventure

Embark on a whimsical journey
with Storyland Adventure! Dress

up as your favourite book
character and dive into your

own fairytale. Today we'll write
our own unique stories, do some
arts and crafts, and take home a
magical mixed fairy tale book.

Daily Fee $94

After Max CCS* $9.41

TUE · 2nd JUL

Balloon Benders

This whimsical wizard won’t
need a wand, just a bag of
balloons and a pocketful of

imagination. With a flick of the
wrist and a twist of the fingers
they turn ordinary balloons into
extraordinary shapes that will

leave you amazed!

Daily Fee $105

After Max CCS* $10.51

WED · 3rd JUL

Rock Climbing

Thrill seeker? Well, get ready for
an action-packed day of

adrenaline-fueled fun at Crank
Indoor Climbing - the ultimate
adventure playground! Run and
flip your way through the heart-
pounding parkour + try out rock
climbing and ninja warrior fun!

Daily Fee $128

After Max CCS* $12.81

THU · 4th JUL

Despicable Me 4

Get ready for mischief and
mayhem as TeamKids joins Gru
& the Minions in ‘Despicable Me

4'. We’re in for a wild ride,
facing off against a

mischievous new rival. Don't
miss out on this exciting

adventure! *PG Film.

Daily Fee $124

After Max CCS* $12.41

FRI · 5th JUL

Drama Dazzle

Cue the drama! We're bringing
theatrical fun to TeamKids today

with an interactive workshop.
Play games, enjoy movement,
improvisation, and prepare a
scene to showcase your new

skills.

Daily Fee $110

After Max CCS* $11.01

FIND A VENUE
TEAMKIDS.COM.AU/VENUES

CHOOSE YOUR ADVENTURE
BOOK TODAY!
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