
*Child Care Subsidies may apply. $5 Admin Fee per family. $5 Late Fees apply within 7 days per child. Payment plans available.

**Experience/Activity Fee. Programs may be subject to change. Third Party Payment Fees apply. See Terms and Conditions for cancellation policy

Preston South Primary
6:30 AM START
6:00 PM END

PLEASE

ARRIVE BY 9AM

ON EXCURSION
DAYS

IN-HOUSE INCURSION EXCURSION

MON · 1st JUL

Storyland
Adventure

Embark on a whimsical journey
with Storyland Adventure! Dress

up as your favourite book
character and dive into your

own fairytale. Today we'll write
our own unique stories, do some
arts and crafts, and take home a
magical mixed fairy tale book.

Daily Fee $88

After Max CCS* $8.80

TUE · 2nd JUL

Ninja Warriors

Get wild and imaginative during
this active session - Ninja

Warrior Style! We’ll wear our
very own Gecko ninja bandannas

and take on awesome ninja
challenges with obstacle courses
and warrior games! *Closed-toe

shoes rqd.

Daily Fee $99

After Max CCS* $9.90

WED · 3rd JUL

Inside Out 2

Are you ready for an emotional
rollercoaster?! TeamKids is off
to see 'Inside Out 2'. Join Joy,

Sadness, and the whole gang for
a heartwarming sequel full of

new adventures and feelings. It's
a journey you won't want to

miss! *PG Film.

Daily Fee $118

After Max CCS* $11.80

THU · 4th JUL

Inflatable World

We're jumping for joy because
TeamKids is going to Inflatable
World, the home of some of the

biggest indoor inflatables in Aus!
We'll climb, leap & crawl through
all the thrilling obstacles. *Socks

required.

Daily Fee $123

After Max CCS* $12.30

FRI · 5th JUL

Take the Stage

Embrace your inner drama king
or queen! Students will kick off
with entertaining acting games,

igniting their creativity and
fostering teamwork. Then they'll
showcase their unique take on a
script – every performance is

different!

Daily Fee $99

After Max CCS* $9.90

MON · 8th JUL

Mobile Butterfly
Enclosure

Today our hearts will flutter as
we step into the mesmerising
world of butterflies. Prepare to

be enchanted as we get up close
to these graceful creatures to
feed and interact with them. It

will be an encounter like no
other!

Daily Fee $99

After Max CCS* $9.90

TUE · 9th JUL

Despicable Me 4

Get ready for mischief and
mayhem as TeamKids joins Gru
& the Minions in ‘Despicable Me

4'. We’re in for a wild ride,
facing off against a

mischievous new rival. Don't
miss out on this exciting

adventure! *PG Film.

Daily Fee $118

After Max CCS* $11.80

WED · 10th JUL

School of
Wizardry: Potions

Calling all Witches and Wizards!
It’s time to unravel the mysteries
of magic and learn the tricks of

the trade during this Potion
Making Workshop! We’ll conjure

up slime and create Dragon's
Milk fireworks!

Daily Fee $105

After Max CCS* $10.50

THU · 11th JUL

Melbourne Zoo

Why don’t leopards play hide &
seek? They’re always spotted!

Today, TeamKids is racing off to
Melbourne Zoo. We’ll roar with

the big cats & howl with the wild
dogs on the magnificent Lion

Gorge trail.

Daily Fee $104

After Max CCS* $10.40

FRI · 12th JUL

The Escape Zone

Are you a sharp thinker? If so,
we have the ultimate adventure
in store for you. Join TeamKids
for an escape room experience
and put your problem-solving

skills to the test. Can you crack
the code and escape in time?

Daily Fee $98

After Max CCS* $9.80

FIND A VENUE
TEAMKIDS.COM.AU/VENUES

CHOOSE YOUR ADVENTURE
BOOK TODAY!
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